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Introduction 
Worldwide, lesbian, gay, bisexual, 
transgender and intersex (LGBTI) 
people contend with exceptionally 
high risks for HIV infection, stigma 
and discrimination, and exclusion 
from HIV and other health services 
(1, 2). The global prevalence of HIV 
among gay men and other men, 
who have sex with men (MSM), is 
19 times higher than in general 
population, and prevalence among 
transgender (TG) is 48 times 
higher (3-5). MSM and TG are at 
high risk because HIV transmission 
is five times more likely to occur 
d u r i n g  u n p r o t e c t e d  a n a l  
intercourse (UAI) than during 
vaginal sex (6). UNAIDS estimates 
suggest that globally, the risk of 
acquiring HIV is 27 times higher 
among MSM, and 13 times higher 
for TG women (7).

Punitive laws and socio-structural 
factors can contribute to the 
higher transmission of HIV and 
other infections in sexual 
minorities, dissuade them from 
seeking treatment, and fuel the 
epidemic of mental health issues 
and suicide . Stigma towards 
persons of different sexual 
orientations and gender identities 
operates at multiple levels, 
including institutional, social, and 
intrapersonal (9). Homophobic 
events and enacted sexual stigma 
were found associated with 
increased odds of engaging in UAI 
(10, 11), lower HIV testing rates 
(12), and lower adherence to 
antiretroviral treatment (13, 14). 
Sexual minorities, who live in 
communities with high levels of 
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anti-gay prejudice experience a 
higher hazard of mortality than 
those living in low-prejudice 
communities, with a shorter life 
expectancy of approximately 12 
years for sexual minorities living in 
high-prejudice communities (15).

Sexual minorities in India report the 
need for support and acceptance 
with the constant pressure to hide 
one's sexual orientation, which 
creates stress. This excessive stress 
and distress make sexual minorities 
in India susceptible to various 
mental health consequences and 
hamper well-being and happiness 
(16 ,  17 ) .  I t  has  economic  
consequences, with an estimated 
cost of homophobia in India, 
accounting for USD 5.2 [2.6 – 7.9] 
billion a year (18).

While European and American 
cultures define happiness as a 
personal achievement, Asian 
culture defines happiness as “a 
realisation of social harmony” (19). 
In India, happiness has a particular 
and  pro found meaning ,  as  
suggested in the Hitopadseša, an 
ancient Indian manuscript, which 
Wiese denoted as “teaching of 
happiness”(20). Longitudinal 
studies indicate that people who are 
happier tend to live longer, 
providing support for happiness as 
a stand-alone indicator of well-
being that should be used more 
widely in social science and health 
research (21). Such studies in 
LGBTI people across countries 
remain scarce.

In low- and middle-income 
countries, LGBT data collection has 
been limited where the HIV 
epidemics are deemed to be more 

generalised. Again, pervasive 
stigma and criminalisation of same-
sex practices have made such data 
collection challenging or absent. 
(22).

Intervention
To evaluate happiness, sex and 
quality of life for LGBTI people, 

n 
online survey developed in 
collaboration with researchers at 
Aix-Marseille University, and the 
University of Minnesota (23).

The survey is a Multi-Lingual cross-
sectional assessment. To probe 
respondents' mental wellness, the 
survey canvasses variables including 
'outness', family support, sexual 
satisfaction, physical health, 
happiness, self-esteem, and the 
internalisation of homophobia. The 
survey aims to explore a likely 
relationship between happiness 
and safe behaviour in the greater 
context of health. Assessing these 
constructs often simultaneously 
helps researchers test and find links 
between wellbeing and related 
variables (24).

An internet sampling method is 
used to conduct this survey 
globally, recruiting consenting adult 
LGBTI participants, including 
participants in India. This approach 
is responsive to increasing research 
interest in technology-enhanced 
methods for research in hard-to-
reach populations, that may 
enhance engagement of potential 
participants living in marginalised 
contexts. Importantly, the diversity 
of literacy, technology use, and 

the 
Joint United Nations Programme on 
HIV and AIDS (UNAIDS) and the 
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overall socio-economic situations 
highlights the need to leverage 
technology to permit flexible, 
adaptive methodology (25).

We strongly encourage country-
specific promotion by concerned 
national HIV and LGBTI NGOs and 
partners sharing a unique URL to 
the survey's landing page at 
suitable country-specific websites 
and networks 

y is open for 
participation until 31 July 2019 and 
takes on average 12 minutes to 
complete.
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